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REPORT  

FRAUDULENT & CORRUPT ACTIVITIES ON GOVERNMENT PROCUREMENT SYSTEM 

_____________________ 

National Anti-Corruption @ 0800 701 701 

Security and Investigating Services – Limpopo Provincial Treasury @ 015 298 7196 

___________________________ 

 

ALL COMPLAINTS/CONCERNS RELATED TO SCM NON-COMPLIANCE MUST BE REPORTED TO: 

LIMPOPO PROVINCIAL TREASURY 

PRIVATE BAG X 9486 

POLOKWANE  

0700 

 

PROVINCIAL TREASURY, FINANCE HOUSE, 56 – 58 PAUL KRUGER STREET, POLOKWANE  
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2. INSTRUCTIONS 

 

1. Bidders are advised to read the entire tender bulletin.   

2. Tenders for procurement of supplies, services and disposals are categorized as follows: 

SUPPLIES 
 Accommodation, leasing of 
 Audio visual equipment 
 Building material 
 Chemicals: Agricultural/Forestry/ 
 Laboratory/Water Care 
 Clothing/Textiles 
 Computer equipment 
 Computer software 
 Electrical equipment 
 Electronic equipment 
 Furniture 
 General 
 Medical 
 Office equipment: Labour-saving devices 
 Perishable provisions 
 Stationary/printing 
 Steel 
 Timber 
 Vehicle (all types) 
 Workshop equipment 
 

SERVICES 
 Building 
 Civil 
 Electrical 
 Functional (including cleaning-, 
 and security services) 
 General 
 Maintenance of electrical, mechanical 
 equipment and plumbing 
 Mechanical 
 Professional 
 Repair and maintenance of vehicles 
 Transport 
 
 
DISPOSALS 
 Clothing and textiles 
 Furniture 
 General 
 Scrap metal 
 Vehicles 

3. Bid documents are generally available in English only. 

4. The address where a bid document is available from and where it must be submitted to may differ. 

5. The addresses at which bid documents may be obtained and to which tenders must be posted, appear in 

Annexure 1. 

6.  The address list of various Supply Chain Management Advice Centres at which bid documents and tender 

bulletins may also be obtained, appear in Annexure 3; and 

7. The address list of Supply Chain Management satellite offices at which tender bulletins may also be obtained, 

appear in 
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3. BID INVITATIONS FOR SUPPLIES, SERVICES AND DISPOSALS 

 
 

 
BID NO. 

 
DESCRIPTION OF  

SERVICE OR SUPPLIES 

 
CONTACT 
DETAILS 

 

 
BID 

DOCUME
NT 

PRICE 
(NON-

REFUND
ABLE) 

 
DUE AT 
11H00 

 
BID 
DOC
UME
NTS 
OBT
AINA
BLE 
FRO

M 

 
POST 

OR 
DELIV

ER 
BIDS 
TO 

See Annexure 
1 & 2, 

Page 11- 12 

 

ACDP 
18/19 
 

Re-Advert: Supply, delivery 
and offloading of Seeds and 
Seedlings for Limpopo 
Department of Agriculture 
and Rural Development 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Department of Agriculture 
and Rural Development 

ADMINISTRATION 
PROCESS  
Me. Mononyane NM @ 
Tel: 015 294 3434/3351 
mononyanenm@agric.limpo

po.gov.za 
 
TECHNICAL ASPECTS  
Mr. Makgato MM @ 
Tel: 015 294 3355 / 
082 371 6462 
makgatomm@agric.limpopo

.gov.za 
 

R85-00 19/03/2020 111 111 

ACDP 
19/12 
 

Re-Advert: Supply, delivery, 
offloading of Fertilizers for 
Limpopo Province 
Department of Agriculture 
and Rural Development for a 
period of three (3) years 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Department of Agriculture 
and Rural Development   

ADMINISTRATION 
PROCESS  
Me. Matodzi TS @ 
Tel: 015 294 3351 
matodzis@agric.limpopo.go

v.za 
Fax: 086 216 7850 
TECHNICAL ASPECTS  
Mr. Mamanyuha L @ 
Tel: 013 294 3149 
mamanyuhal@agric.limpop

o.gov.za 

R85-00 19/03/2020 111 111 



LIMPOPO PROVINCIAL TENDER BULLETIN NO 41 OF 2019/20 FY, 14 FEBRUARY 2020 

  

 

NOT FOR SALE Page 6 
    

LDPWRI-
HR/ 19001 

Appointment of a Training 
Service Provider to provide a 
one (1) year Certificate in 
Construction studies and 
Recognition of Prior Learning 
(RPL) Process for B-Tech 
Qualification in Construction 
Studies  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Department of Public 
Works 

ADMINISTRATION 
PROCESS  
Makaringe C & Malapane 
Suzan @ 
Tel: 015 284 7676/7531 
Fax: 015 284 7034 
makaringec@dpw.limpopo.

gov.za 
malapanehs@dpw.limpopo.

gov.za 
 
 
TECHNICAL ASPECTS  
Ms Kaseke L @ 
Tel: 015 284 7156 
mokonyamaw@dpw.limpop

o.gov.za 
 

R85-00 09/03/2020 110 110 

LDPWRI-
ROADS/ 
19001 

Appointment of Professional 
Environmental Consultant to 
investigate Contamination in 
Government Garages and 
Cost Centres and 
Compilation of Site 
Assessment reports and 
remediation plans or 
monitoring plans in areas 
where there is contamination, 
Capricorn and Vhembe 
Districts 
 
NB: Only service provider 
(s) who are EME or QSE, 
which are, at least 51% 
owned by black people will 
be considered for this bid 
as per Preferential 
Procurement Regulations 
2017.   
 
Compulsory briefing 
session: 
Date:  27 February 2020 
Time:  11H00 
Venue: Dep. of Public Works, 
43 Church Street, Works 
Towers, Polokwane 
 
 
Department of Public 
Works 

ADMINISTRATION 
PROCESS  
Makaringe C & Malapane 
Suzan @ 
Tel: 015 284 7676/7531 
Fax: 015 284 7034 
makaringec@dpw.limpopo.

gov.za 
malapanehs@dpw.limpopo.

gov.za 
 
 
TECHNICAL ASPECTS  
Ms Mashamba T @ 
Tel: 015 284 7497/ 
 066 423 3766 
Mashambat3@dpw.limpopo

.gov.za 
 

R85-00 09/03/2020 110 110 
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LDPWRI-
ROADS/ 
19002 

Appointment of Professional 
Environmental Consultant to 
investigate Contamination in 
Government Garages and 
Cost Centres and 
Compilation of Site 
Assessment reports and 
remediation plans or 
monitoring plans in areas 
where there is contamination, 
Mopani Districts 
 
 
NB: Only service provider 
(s) who are EME or QSE, 
which are, at least 51% 
owned by black people will 
be considered for this bid 
as per Preferential 
Procurement Regulations 
2017. 
 
  
Compulsory briefing 
session: 
Date:  27 February 2020 
Time:  11H00 
Venue: Dep. of Public Works, 
43 Church Street, Works 
Towers, Polokwane 
 
 
Department of Public 
Works 

ADMINISTRATION 
PROCESS  
Makaringe C & Malapane 
Suzan @ 
Tel: 015 284 7676/7531 
Fax: 015 284 7034 
makaringec@dpw.limpopo.

gov.za 
malapanehs@dpw.limpopo.

gov.za 
 
 
TECHNICAL ASPECTS  
Ms Mashamba T @ 
Tel: 015 284 7497/ 
 066 423 3766 
Mashambat3@dpw.limpopo

.gov.za 
 

R85-00 09/03/2020 110 110 

LDPWRI-
ROADS/ 
19003 

Appointment of Professional 
Environmental Consultant to 
investigate Contamination in 
Government Garages and 
Cost Centres and 
Compilation of Site 
Assessment reports and 
remediation plans or 
monitoring plans in areas 
where there is contamination, 
Waterberg Districts. 
 
NB: Only service provider 
(s) who are EME or QSE, 
which are, at least 51% 
owned by black people will 
be considered for this bid 

ADMINISTRATION 
PROCESS  
Makaringe C & Malapane 
Suzan @ 
Tel: 015 284 7676/7531 
Fax: 015 284 7034 
makaringec@dpw.limpopo.

gov.za 
malapanehs@dpw.limpopo.

gov.za 
 
 
TECHNICAL ASPECTS  
Ms Mashamba T @ 
Tel: 015 284 7497/ 
 066 423 3766 

R85-00 09/03/2020 110 110 
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as per Preferential 
Procurement Regulations 
2017.   
 
 
 
Compulsory briefing 
session: 
Date:  27 February 2020 
Time:  11H00 
Venue: Dep. of Public Works, 
43 Church Street, Works 
Towers, Polokwane 
 
 
Department of Public 
Works 

Mashambat3@dpw.limpopo
.gov.za 

 

LDPWRI-
ROADS/ 
19004 

Appointment of Professional 
Environmental Consultant to 
investigate Contamination in 
Government Garages and 
Cost Centres and 
Compilation of Site 
Assessment reports and 
remediation plans or 
monitoring plans in areas 
where there is contamination, 
Sekhukhune Districts 
 
NB: Only service provider 
(s) who are EME or QSE, 
which are, at least 51% 
owned by black people will 
be considered for this bid 
as per Preferential 
Procurement Regulations 
2017. 
 
  
Compulsory briefing 
session: 
Date:  27 February 2020 
Time:  11H00 
Venue: Dep. of Public Works, 
43 Church Street, Works 
Towers, Polokwane 
 
 
Department of Public 
Works 

ADMINISTRATION 
PROCESS  
Makaringe C & Malapane 
Suzan @ 
Tel: 015 284 7676/7531 
Fax: 015 284 7034 
makaringec@dpw.limpopo.

gov.za 
malapanehs@dpw.limpopo.

gov.za 
 
 
TECHNICAL ASPECTS  
Ms Mashamba T @ 
Tel: 015 284 7497/ 
 066 423 3766 
Mashambat3@dpw.limpopo

.gov.za 
 

R85-00 09/03/2020 110 110 
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LDPWRI-P/ 
19011 

Supply, Design, Hang 
Curtains, Voile, Lace 
Curtains, Curtain Rails, Blinds 
and Rods for 44 Houses at 
Parliamentary Village at 
Capricorn District for a Period 
of Three (3) Years 
 
 
 
Compulsory briefing 
session: 
Date:  02 March 2020 
Time:  11H00 
Venue: Dep. of Public Works, 
43 Church Street, Works 
Towers, Polokwane 
 
 
Department of Public 
Works 

ADMINISTRATION 
PROCESS  
Makaringe C & Malapane 
Suzan @ 
Tel: 015 284 7676/7531 
Fax: 015 284 7034 
makaringec@dpw.limpopo.

gov.za 
malapanehs@dpw.limpopo.

gov.za 
 
 
TECHNICAL ASPECTS  
Mr Mokonyama W @ 
Tel: 015 284 7211 
mokonyamaw@dpw.limpop

o.gov.za 
 

R85-00 09/03/2020 110 110 

LDPWRI-P/ 
19012 

Supply Household Furniture 
And To Collect Old Ones 
From The Parliamentary 
Village To Capricorn District 
for a period of three (3) years 
 
 
 
Compulsory briefing 
session: 
Date:  02 March 2020 
Time:  09H00 
Venue: Dep. of Public Works, 
43 Church Street, Works 
Towers, Polokwane 
 
 
Department of Public 
Works 

ADMINISTRATION 
PROCESS  
Makaringe C & Malapane 
Suzan @ 
Tel: 015 284 7676/7531 
Fax: 015 284 7034 
makaringec@dpw.limpopo.

gov.za 
malapanehs@dpw.limpopo.

gov.za 
 
 
TECHNICAL ASPECTS  
Mr Mokonyama W @ 
Tel: 015 284 7211 
mokonyamaw@dpw.limpop

o.gov.za 
 

R85-00 09/03/2020 110 110 
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4. ADDENDUM 

 
 
4.1 DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS, ROADS & INFRASTRUCTURE 
 

 
Advertisement were placed in the Provincial Tender Bulletin 39 of 2019/20 FY on Friday, 31 January 2020 
 
All interested parties are hereby requested to note the correction of tender no. LDPWRI-B/19002 for Appointment of 
a service provider for repair and maintenance of Accessible Lifts for a period of thirty six (36) months in the 
Limpopo Department of Public Works Roads and Infrastructure (LDPWRI). 
 
The original bid document was issued with an incomplete Functionality Evaluation Criteria. 
 
All interested parties are hereby requested to note the correction of the Functionality Evaluation Criteria included in 
tender document. 
 
Bidders who have already purchased the tender documents should come and collect the copy of the 
Addendum or download a copy of the Addendum on www.etenders.gov.za and furthermore the department 
will forward to the Bidders who have already bought the bid document. 
 
Bidder who will be purchasing the bid document will be issued with the original bid document and an 
addendum. Furthermore bidders should take note that the closing date of the bid will 25 February 2020 as the 
tender advert. 
 
For any clarity, please do not hesitate to contact the following SCM officials:  
 
Ms. Makaringe C 
Email: Makaringec@dpw.limpopo.gov.za 
Tel: (015) 284 7142 
 
Ms. Malapane H.S 
Email: Malapanehs@dpw.limpopo.gov.za 
Tel: (015) 284 7531 
 
    
 
 
 
                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                       
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

http://www.etenders.gov.za/
mailto:Makaringec@dpw.limpopo.gov.za
mailto:Malapanehs@dpw.limpopo.gov.za
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5 .AWARDED BIDS 

 
 
 
5.1 LIMPOPO ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT AGENCY 
 
 

 BID NO AWARDED 
BIDDER 

PROJECT  
DESCRIPTION 

AMOUNT DATE 
AWARDED 

POINTS 

LEDA/OSS/
2019/20-6C 

Letlho 
Promtique 
Consortium 

Appointment of a principal 
contractor/consortium service 
provider for the refurbishment of 
Limpopo Tourism Agency (LTA) 
building for the establishment of 
Invest SA Limpopo One Stop 
Shop 

R5 836 256.00 20/12/2019 80.00 

 
 
 
 
  
 

5.2 DEPARTMENT OF CO-OPERATIVE GOVERNANCE, HUMAN SETTLEMENTS & TRADITIONAL AFFAIRS 
 
 
 
 

Bid no Bid Description  Successful Bidder 

 Total 
Points 

Attained 

Date 
Approved  

CoGHSTA 
B04/ 2019-

20 FY 
 

Database of contractors for 
construction of Low Cost 
Houses for a period of three 
years. 

 

Ramkol Construction and 
Projects cc 

               
100.00  

 31 January 
2020 

Mamondo Development and 
Construction cc 

               
100.00  

Rheiland Investment cc 
               

100.00  

Rangata Solutions Pty Ltd 
               

100.00  

Mathara Investments cc 
               

100.00  

Terrytlou Trading and Projects 
Pty Ltd 

               
100.00  

Mangatlu Trading Enterprise 
 

               
100.00  
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Bid no Bid Description  Successful Bidder 

 Total 
Points 

Attained 

Date 
Approved  

*Capotex Construction  
               

100.00  

Molanco Trading Enterprise Pty 
Ltd 

               
100.00  

*Mogwape Business Enterprise 
               

100.00  

Nax Most Construction 
               

100.00  

Mabaleng Civils and Projects Pty 
Ltd 

               
100.00  

*MTR Business Enterprise 
               

100.00  

I Ndlovu Idle Mithi Construction 
Pty Ltd 

               
100.00  

Ditlou Suppliers 
               

100.00  

*Thale Civils and Projects Pty Ltd 
               

100.00  

Tsa - Tshidi Trading 
               

100.00  

Jaynox Pty Ltd 
               

100.00  

Procost and Associates Pty Ltd 
               

100.00  

Wenzile Wheels Pty Ltd 
               

100.00  

Mahlogo wa Pheladi Business 
Enterprise 

               
100.00  

Lekgothwane Ramasela Trading 
Enterprise 

               
100.00  

MDB Projects 
               

100.00  

Mabu Consultants Pty Ltd 
               

100.00  

Mampje Trading Pty Ltd 
               

100.00  

Khumo Holdings 
 
 

       
100.00  

Thakgoga Projects cc 
               

100.00  

Estacol Pty Ltd 
               

100.00  

Kimberly and Associates Trading 
               

100.00  

Veeking Productions 
               

100.00  
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Bid no Bid Description  Successful Bidder 

 Total 
Points 

Attained 

Date 
Approved  

Kwena-Meetseng Construction & 
Trading Enterprise 

               
100.00  

Mothikeni Investment 
               

100.00  

Fanang Diatla Business 
Enterprise & Construction 

               
100.00  

Koketji Enterprice 
               

100.00  

Nea Projects 
               

100.00  

Carorox Pty Ltd 
               

100.00  

Khanaba Business Enterprise 
               

100.00  

Ngwacon Developers  
               

100.00  

Madeph Technical Service 
               

100.00  

Cateco Trading Enterprise 
               

100.00  

Selaleo Trading Enterprise 
               

100.00  

Prudev Trading Enterprise Pty 
Ltd 

               
100.00  

Desert Kite Group 
 

               
100.00  

Bukuta cc 
 
 
 

               
100.00  

 Kwenabel Trading 
               

100.00  

Deep Space Construction 
               

100.00  

Linspire 
               

100.00  

Mavestra Construction & 
Cleaning Service 

               
100.00  

SMTM Construction 
               

100.00  

High Point Trading 367 cc 
               

100.00  

Melt Architects  
               

100.00  

Dimza Trading Pty Ltd 
               

100.00  
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Bid no Bid Description  Successful Bidder 

 Total 
Points 

Attained 

Date 
Approved  

Mphera Trading Enterprise 
               

100.00  

Mococo Tourism and Projects 
               

100.00  

Rivoni Cleaning Services 
               

100.00  

Gideon Property Developers 
               

100.00  

MT General Construction  
               

100.00  

Silver Edge Trading 25 cc 
               

100.00  

GPMVR Multi Projects 
               

100.00  

Monala General Trade 
               

100.00  

Maleko Projects and Construction 
 

               
100.00  

Cascade Pivotal Projects 
 
 

               
100.00  

SDN Civils Pty Ltd 
               

100.00  

Bonumart Pty Ltd 
               

100.00  

Moja B Trading & Development 
 

               
100.00  

Riverwalk Trading 497 
 

               
100.00  

Mashrik Social Development 
Consultancy 
 

               
100.00  

Ashkale Projects 
               

100.00  

Mavhitso Sa Pty Ltd 
               

100.00  

Quality Construction and Projects 
Pty Ltd 

               
100.00  

Shieretse Business Enterprise 
               

100.00  

Ndalamo BE 
               

100.00  

Lupikopi Trading and Projects 
               

100.00  

Kgakwana Construction and 
Enterprise 

               
100.00  



LIMPOPO PROVINCIAL TENDER BULLETIN NO 41 OF 2019/20 FY, 14 FEBRUARY 2020 

  

 

NOT FOR SALE Page 15 
    

Bid no Bid Description  Successful Bidder 

 Total 
Points 

Attained 

Date 
Approved  

Mmamoloko Trading Enterprise 
               

100.00  

Thaba and Sons Projects 
               

100.00  

Firm Supply Trading Pty Ltd 
               

100.00  

*Alasca General Construction cc 
               

100.00  

Mzerewa Group 
               

100.00  

Stonefound 
 
 

               
100.00  

Hlales BE 
               

100.00  

Koephu Business Enterprise 
                

98.00  

Tswaraganang Development 
                

98.00  

Phepele Construction 
                

98.00  

Ixplore 
                

92.00  

Zorha Khan Developers 
                

80.00  

Somandla Trading 14 
                

80.00  

Lishmok General Trading 
                

80.00  

Malatsane Trading Enterprise Pty 
Ltd 

                
80.00  

Aventino Group 
                

80.00  

Lebogang Katlego Business 
Project 

                
80.00  

Fastrak Trading 728 
                

80.00  

Dichikane Construction 
 
 

                
80.00  

Ngungwa Development cc 
 
 

                
80.00  

*Perrizin Homes 
 
 

                
80.00  
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Bid no Bid Description  Successful Bidder 

 Total 
Points 

Attained 

Date 
Approved  

Gvardit Trading 
 
 

                
80.00  

Moneri Holdings Pty Ltd 
                

80.00  

Selete Trading Enterprise 
                

80.00  
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6. SPECIAL NOTICES 

 
 
 
 
6.1. LIMPOPO PROVINCIAL TREASURY 
 
6.1.1 (SCM ADVICE CENTERS):  
ADVERTISEMENTS OF LIMPOPO CSD CALL CENTRE LINES FOR SUPPLIERS  
 
LIMPOPO CSD CALL CENTRE LINES FOR SUPPLIERS  

DISTRICT 
 
 

CALL CENTRE NUMBER OFFICIAL RESPONSIBLE TIME 

Capricorn 015 291 2684 Mr. Kgomo AE 07H30 TO 16H30 

Mopani 015 812 0256 Ms. Nxumalo P 07H30 TO 16H30 

Sekhukhune 013 265 1071 Mrs Morena MM 07H30 TO 16H30 

Vhembe 015 962 0014 Mrs. Nefolovhodwe MQ 07H30 TO 16H30 

Waterberg 014 717 1376 Mrs. Tsatsi AT 07H30 TO 16H30 

 
 
 
 
 
 
6.1.2 SCM Advice Centres 
THE ADVERTISEMENT OF WORKSHOPS/ROADSHOWS AS PER DISTRICT: 
 
 
 
MOPANI SUPPLY CHAIN MANAGEMENT ADVICE CENTRE 
(Centralized Supplier Procurement Roadshow program) 

DATE MUNICIPALITY VENUE TARGET TIME 

20/02/2020 Letaba Soetfontein 
Community Hall  

All  10H00 

 
 
 
CAPRICORN SUPPLY CHAIN MANAGEMENT ADVICE CENTRE 
(Centralized Supplier Procurement Workshop program) 

DATE MUNICIPALITY VENUE TARGET TIME 

20/02/2020 Lepelle-Nkumpi Mafefe Tribal 
Authority Hall 

Youth 10H00 
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VHEMBE SUPPLY CHAIN MANAGEMENT ADVICE CENTRE 
(Centralized Supplier Procurement Roadshow program) 

DATE MUNICIPALITY VENUE TARGET TIME 

20/02/2020 Collins Chabane Hlanganani: 
Njhakanjhaka 
Community Hall 

All 10H00 

 
 
SEKHUKHUNE SUPPLY CHAIN MANAGEMENT ADVICE CENTRE 
(Centralized Supplier Procurement Roadshow program) 

DATE MUNICIPALITY VENUE TARGET TIME 

21/02/2020 Ephraim Mogale Leeufontein All  10H00 
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ANNEXURE 1:   ADDRESS LIST AND CONTACT DETAILS: LIMPOPO PROVINCIAL DEPARMENTS 

UNIQUE 
REF. 
NO. 

BID 
DOCUMENT 
REFERENCE 

 
CONTACT DETAILS 
 

 
DOCUMENTS SOLD AT: 

 
DOCUMENTS DEPOSITED 
AT 

 
100 

DSDP 

 
Tel:  015 293 6000 
Fax: 015 293 6211 
Website: www.limpopo.gov.za 

Department of Social Development, 
Office No. 57 Ground Floor, 21 Biccard 
Street POLOKWANE  

Deposited in the box located at 
Department of Social 
Development, 21 Biccard Street 
Polokwane 

 
101 

LPT 

 
Tel: 015 298 7000 
Fax: 015 295 7010 
Website: www.limpopo.gov.za 

Provincial Treasury  46 Hans Van 
Rensburg Street, POLOKWANE and all 
Provincial Treasury Tender Advice Centres 

Deposited in the bid box located 
outside a guard house at Ismini 
Towers, 46 Hans Van Rensburg 
Street, Polokwane 

 
101A TC/LP 

 

 
Tel:  015 291 8400 
Fax:  015 295 3310 
Website: www.limpopo.gov.za 

Provincial Treasury  56 – 58  Paul Kruger 
Street, POLOKWANE and all Provincial 
Treasury Tender Advice Centres 

Deposited in the bid box located 
in the main entrance, Finance 
House Building, 56-58 Paul 
Kruger Street, Polokwane 

 
102 

PRDP  

 
Tel: 015 287 6000 
Fax: 015 295 3840 
Website: www.limpopo.gov.za 

Office of the Premier, 40 Hans van 
Rensburg Street, POLOKWANE and all 
SCM Advice Centres 

Deposited in the bid box located 
at Mowaneng Building, 40 Hans 
van Rensburg Street, Polokwane 

 
103 

HEDP 

 
Tel:  015 293 6000 
Fax: 015 293 6211 
Website: www.limpopo.gov.za 

Department of Health, Office No. D3 
Ground Floor, Old Capricorn Building, 18 
College Street, POLOKWANE and all 
Provincial Treasury Tender Advice Centres 

Deposited in the box located at 
Department of Health and Social 
Development, 18 College Street, 
Polokwane 

 
 

104 
LPEDT 

 
Tel:  015 290 7600/1 
Fax: 015 297 4494 
Website: www.limpopo.gov.za 

Department of Education, Corner 113 
Biccard and 24 Excelsior Streets, 
POLOKWANE and all Provincial Treasury 
Tender Advice Centres 

Deposited in the bid box located 
in the main entrance of corner 
113 Biccard Street and Excelsior 
Street, Polokwane 

 
 

105 
PUDP 

 
Tel:  015 295 1000 
Fax: 015 295 1163 
Website: www.limpopo.gov.za 

 Department of Roads & Transport , 40 
Paul Kruger Street, POLOKWANE and all 
Provincial Treasury Tender Advice Centres 

Deposited in the bid box located 
at 1st Floor, Paul Kruger Wing, 40 
Paul Kruger Street, Polokwane 

 
 

106 
         DSSL 

 
Tel:  015 290 2900 
Fax: 015 291 4452 
Website: www.limpopo.gov.za 

Department of Safety, Security and 
Liaison, 32 Schoeman Street, 
POLOKWANE and all Provincial Treasury 
Tender Advice Centres 

Deposited in the bid box located 
in the main entrance of 32 
Schoeman Street, Polokwane 

 
 

107 
COGHSTA 

 
Tel:  015 294 2000 
Fax: 015 295 4190 
Website: www.limpopo.gov.za 

Department of Co-Operative 
Governance, Human Settlements & 
Traditional Affairs, 28 Market Street, 
Office No. G 74, Ground Floor, Polokwane. 

Deposited in the bid box located 
at Hensa Towers, Cnr of Rabe 
and Landdros Mare Streets, 
Polokwane 

 
 

108 DSAC 

 
Tel:  015 284 4000 
Fax: 015 284 4514 
Website: www.limpopo.gov.za 

 Department of Sport, Arts and Culture 
Olympic Towers, Corner Rabe and Biccard 
Street, POLOKWANE and all Provincial 
Treasury Tender Advice Centre 

Deposited in the bid box located 
in the main entrance of Olympic 
Towers, Corner  21 Rabe and 
Biccard Street, Polokwane 

 
 

109 
LEDET 

 
Tel:  015 293 8300 
Fax: 015 293 8319 
Website: www.limpopo.gov.za 

Department of Economic Development, 
Environment & Tourism, 90 Bok Street, 
POLOKWANE and all SCM Advice Centres  

Deposited in the bid box located 
in the main entrance of Evridiki 
Towers, 19 Biccard Street, 
Polokwane 

 
110 

 
LDPW & 
WODP 

 
Tel:  015 284 7000 
Fax: 015 284 7031 
Website: www.limpopo.gov.za 

Department of Public Works, Roads and 
Infrastructure 
 
; Towers, 43 Church Street, POLOKWANE 
and all Provincial Treasury Tender Advice 
Centres 

Deposited in the bid box located 
at Corner Blaawberg and River 
Street Ladanna Polokwane 0699 
Private Bag X9490 Polokwane 
0700 

 
111 

 
ACDP 

 
Tel:  015 294 3000/30/60/90/20 
Fax: 015 294 4506 
Website: www.limpopo.gov.za 

Department of Agriculture, Temo Towers, 
69 Biccard Street, POLOKWANE and all 
Provincial Treasury Tender Advice Centres 
                                                          

Deposited in the bid box located 
in the main entrance of 
AgriVillage, 69 Biccard Street, 
Polokwane 

http://www.limpopo.gov.za/
http://www.limpopo.gov.za/
http://www.limpopo.gov.za/
http://www.limpopo.gov.za/
http://www.limpopo.gov.za/
http://www.limpopo.gov.za/
http://www.limpopo.gov.za/
http://www.limpopo.gov.za/
http://www.limpopo.gov.za/
http://www.limpopo.gov.za/
http://www.limpopo.gov.za/
http://www.limpopo.gov.za/
http://www.limpopo.gov.za/
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ANNEXURE 2:   ADDRESS LIST AND CONTACT DETAILS: LIMPOPO PUBLIC ENTITIES 
 

 
UNIQUE 

REF. 
NO. 

BID 
DOCUMENT 
REFERENCE 

 
CONTACT 
DETAILS 

 
DOCUMENTS 

SOLD AT: 

 
DOCUMENTS 

DEPOSITED AT 

 
112 

 
RFB: LIMP 

 
Tel: 015 293 3621 
Fax: 015 293 3660 
Website: www.golimpopo.co 
. 

State Information Technology 
Agency (SITA) Limpopo Office, 
Moolman Building, 27 Market Street, 
POLOKWANE, 0699 
 

Bid box located in the Main 
Entrance of Moolman Building, 27 
Market Street, Polokwane 
 

 
113 

 
LTA 

 
Tel: 015 293 3600 
Fax: 015 293 3655 
Website: www.golimpopo.com 
 

Limpopo Tourism Agency, 
 ERF 92/688, Portion 2 Southern 
Gateway, Ext 4, N1 Main Road, 
Polokwane 0699 

Bid box located in the  offices 
ERF 92/688, Portion 2 Southern 
Gateway, Ext 4, N1 Main Road, 
Polokwane 0699 

 
114 

 
LGB 

 
Tel: 015 295 5581 
Fax: 015 295 3566 
Website: www.lgb.org 
 

Limpopo Gambling Board,  
22 Schoeman Street, POLOKWANE, 
from 08H30 to 16H00 

Bid box located in the main 
entrance, ground floor, 22 
Schoeman Street, Polokwane 
 

 
115 

 
LEDA 

 
Tel: 015 633 4700 
Fax: 015 633 4854 
Website: www.leda.co.za 
 

Limpopo Economic Development 
Agency 
Enterprise Development Finance, Main 
Road Lebowakgomo 

Bid box located in the main 
entrance, Enterprise 
Development Finance, Main Road 
Lebowakgomo 

 
116 

 
RAL 

 
Tel: 015 284 4600 
Fax: 015 284 4701 
Website: www.ral.co.za 
 

Road Agency Limpopo (RAL), RAL 
Towers, 26 Rabe Street, 
POLOKWANE, 0700 

Bid box located in the entrance 
foyer (ground floor) of RAL 
Towers, at 26 Rabe Street, 
Polokwane 

 
117 

 
GAAL 

 
Tel: 015 288 0122 
Fax: 015 288 0346 
Website: www.gaal.co.za 
 

Gateway Airports Authority Limited, 
N1 Road to Louis Trichardt, Army Base, 
POLOKWANE International Airport, 
Polokwane, 0700 

Bid box located in the main 
entrance, ground floor of 
administration building, 
Polokwane International Airport, 
Army Base 

 
118 

 
      VIVET 

Tel: 015 963 3156 
Fax: 015 963 3154 
Website: www.fetcol@mweb.co.za 
 

Vhembe FET College, Stand No. 203, 
Unit A, Sibasa, 0970, Limpopo Province 

Vhembe Fet College, Central 
Office, Private Bag X2136, 
SIBASA 0970 

119 WTVET Tel: 015 491 8581/8602 
Fax: 015 491 8579 
Website: www.procurement 
@waterbergcollege .co.za 

Waterberg FET College,  
Central Office, 36 Hooge Street Street, 
Mokopane, 0600 

Waterberg FET College,  
Central Office, 36 Hooge Street 
Street, Mokopane,  Private Bag x 
2449, Mokopane 0600 

120  GNT Tel. 015 291 2641  
Fax. 015 291 2648  

No. 130a Marshall Street, 
Polokwane.0700  

Great North Transport  
No. 130 Marshall Street, 
Polokwane.0700  

122 MT Tel. 015 2907715/7772  
 

Mvula Trust 
25 Rhodesdrift Street, Rhodesdrift 
Office Park, Bendor Ext 30, Polokwane 

Mvula Trust 
25 Rhodesdrift Street, Rhodesdrift 
Office Park, Bendor Ext 30, 
Polokwane 

123 CCTVET Tel.015 230 1800 
Fax. 015 291 2767 

Capricorn College for TVET 
16 Market Street, Polokwane 

Private Bag  Bag X9674 
Polokwane0700 

124 IDT Tel: 015 295 0000 
Fax: 015 295 6559 

Independent Development Trust 
22 Hans van Rensburg Street, 
Polokwane, 0700 

Independent Development 
Trust 
P.O.Box 55386 
Polokwane 0700 

 

http://www.golimpopo.co/
http://www.golimpopo.com/
http://www.lgb.org/
http://www.leda.co.za/
http://www.ral.co.za/
http://www.gaal.co.za/
http://www.fetcol@mweb.co.za
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ANNEXURE 3: ADDRESS LIST AND CONTACT DETAILS: PROVINCIAL TREASURY TENDER ADVICE CENTRES 

(Tender bulletins and bid documents are obtainable from the following Centers): 
 

 
PROVINCIAL TREASURY SUPPLY CHAIN MANAGEMENT ADVICE CENTRES 

 

 
HEAD OFFICE 
 
Provincial Supply Chain Management Office 
56 – 58 Paul Kruger Street 
POLOKWANE 
Private Bag x9494 
POLOKWANE, 0700 

  Tel No. (015) 291 8400 
 
Contact: Ms. M.B Rakubu     @  Tel: 015 291 8717/6   
                
 

 

 
Capricorn SCM Advice Centre 
 
Limpopo Provincial Treasury 
56-58 Paul Kruger Street 
Private Bag x9494 
POLOKWANE, 0700 
Tel No. (015) 291 8400 
 
Contact Person:  Ms. M.M. Masindi  

 
Vhembe SCM Advice Centre 
 
Limpopo Provincial Treasury 
Government Building Complex 
BLOCK E GROUND FLOOR 
THOHOYANDOU, VENDA 
Tel: (015) 962 1752 
Fax: (015) 962 1282 
 
Contact Person: Ms. A Manena 
 

 
 
 

 
Mopani SCM Advice Centre 
 
Limpopo Provincial Treasury 
Private Bag X 1973 
GIYANI, 0826 
Tel: (015) 812 0149 
Fax: 086 219 7905 
 
Contact Person: Mr. G Muravha   
 
 
 
 
 

 
Waterberg SCM Advice Centre 
 
Limpopo Provincial Treasury 
98 Nelson Mandela Street 
Decimale  Building 
MODIMOLLE 
Tel: (014) 717 5837 
Fax: (014) 717 5670 
 
Contact Person: Mr. AT Tsatsi                

 
 
 
 
 

 
Sekhukhune SCM Advice Centre 
 
Limpopo Provincial Treasury 
Lefa Centre, Schoonoord Road 
JANE FURSE 
Tel: (013) 265 1344 
Fax: (013) 265 1354 
 
Contact Person: Mr. M. S. Sehale  
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ANNEXURE 4: ADDRESS LIST AND CONTACT DETAILS: SATELLITE OFFICES  
 (Tender bulletins are obtainable from the following centers) 
 

CAPRICORN 
 

VHEMBE MOPANI WATERBERG SEKHUKHUNE 

  
 

Libsa Thabazimbi: No.08 
Riet Bok Street 
Tel. No. (014) 772 2437  
 

 

   Libsa Lephalale  
No. 3A Venter Street 
Tel. No. (014) 763 2834  
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